
Convention Services 
 

Uncertainty in Artificial 
Intelligence  

July 11th-15th  
 

Reference Code: 45N1636 
 
 

Reservations 
To reserve your special meeting 
rates, please provide your reference 
code when making reservations 
online or over the phone. 
 
You can also make your 
reservations online at  
Enterprise.com or call Enterprise 
Directly: 

• U.S.: 1.800.261.7331 
 
At the time of reservation, the 
meeting rates will be compared to 
other Enterprise rates and you will 
be quoted the best comparable rate 
available 
 
 
 

General Information 
 
Meeting rates are guaranteed from 
six days prior through four days 
after the meeting dates and are 
subject to availability, Advanced 
reservations are recommended.  
Government surcharges, taxes, tax 
reimbursement, airport related fees, 
vehicle licensing fees, and optional 
items, such as refueling or 
additional drivers, are extra.  
Minimum rental age is 21 (age 
differential for 21-24 applies).  
Standard rental conditions, 
qualifications and return restrictions 
apply. 

Approximate rates available from all 
Seattle locations for rental start dates July 

11th-15th* 
 

 Economy: 39.09 
             Intermediate: 42.49 
  Standard: 45.04 
                          Fullsize: 46.74 
                        Premium: 50.99 
                Mid-size SUV: 76.49 

Large SUV: 101.99             
Minivan 7 seats: 101.99 

 
 
 
*includes 15% discount 
                              
 

Garmin 
In-Car Navigation Guides You 

Wherever You Want To Go 
 

Garmin uses the Global Positioning 
System (GPS) – with smart sensors to 
achieve the accuracy needed for true 

turn-by-turn guidance. 
 

Daily Rental Fee Applies 


